
BIDS RECEIVED

NAME OF BIDDER SCOZZARI BUILDERS INC. BEST RESTORATION SERVICES INC. PAX MUNDUS EXTERISE LLC
RICASOLI & SANTIN CONTRACTING CO. 

INC. 

ADDRESS 1891 NORTH OLDEN AVENUE 23 GRAND AVE STE 4 7 TAMARON COURT 4 FERNDALE AVE 

CITY, STATE, ZIP TRENTON NJ, 08638 FARMINGDALE NY, 11735 MONMOUTH JUNCTION , NJ 08852 MERCERVILLE NJ, 08619

CONTACT LEONARD J. SCOZZARI ZIA REHMAN M. ILYAS CHAUDRY ROBERT J. HEARN 

TELEPHONE 609-989-1221 516-422-2023 609-373-6227 609-588-9539

E-MAIL LSCOZZARI@SCOZZARI.COM AR@BRSERVICEINC.COM PAXMUNDUS@OUTLOOK.COM BOBHEARHJR@YAHOO.COM 

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A SBE N/A 

ADDENDUM NO.ONE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

BID BOND GREAT MIDWEST 10% NTE 20K
FIRST INDEMNITY OF AMERICA 

INSURANCE CO 10% NTE BID TOTAL

SELECTIVE INSURANCE CO OF AMERICA 

10% NTE 20K

SWISS CORP OF AMERICA INSURANCE 10 

% NTE 20K

CONSENT OF SURETY RICHARD V. DOBBS AIF WITH POA GARY A CARDINALE AIF WITH POA SCOTT R. KUZMIC AIF WITH POA VICENT GIORGIO AIF WITH POA

HVAC SUB CONTRACTOR 

THERMAL PIPING, PW#29847 

EXPIRES 3.21.26, BRC OK, LICENSE 

EXPIRES 6.30.26

KING SOLIMAN AND SON LLC, 

PW#662501 EXPIRES 12.22.27 BRC OK, 

LICENSE EXPIRES 10.27.26

BINSKY & SYNDER LLC PW# 69466 

EXPIRES 4.10.26, BRC OK, LICENSE OK

ELECTRICAL SUB CONTRACTOR 

MJF ELECTRICAL CONTRACTING 

(SBE ), PW#619432 EXPIRES 12.7.25, 

BRC OK, LICENSE EXPIRES 3.21.27

SONNY ELECTRIC INC. PW#606945 

EXPIRES 6.26.27 ( NEED BRC AND 

LICENSE IF AWARDED) 

All  ELECTRICAL CONSTRACTOR 

INC.PW#719813 EXPIRES 4.19.26 BRC OK 

, LICENSE EXPIRES  3..31.27

LAMANNA ELECTRIC INC. PW#602174 

EXPIRES 4.5.26, BRC OK, LICENSE OK

STEEL SUB CONTRACTOR 

SOUTHERN NJ STEEL CO. INC 

PW#603821 EXPIRES 4.29.26, BRC 

OK

IN-HOUSE 
INDUSTRIAL SERVICES ENTERPRISES INC. 

PW#622244 EXPIRES 2.19.27 BRC OK

CAPITOL STEEL PRODUCTS INC. 

PW#608424 EXPIRES 8.22.27 , BRC OK 

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE 

REQUIREMENTS 
SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

PREVAILING WAGE CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AN DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT B INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

AA201 REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

PW CONTRACTOR REG. 589040 EXPIRES 6.28.26 748427 EXPIRES 6.17.26 691905 EXPIRES 1.2.26 603759 EXPIRES 2.26.26

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS 

REGISTRATION
OK OK OK OK

FEDERAL DEBARMENT FORM SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED

SAFETY CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EQUIPMENT CERT SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

 THREE REFERENCES PC TO REVIEW PC TO REVIEW PC TO REVIEW PC TO REVIEW 

BID RESULTS

AB2025-44 STRUCTURAL REPAIRS AND ALTERATIONS TO THE ICE SKATING FACILITES FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION

BID OPENING DATE:  DECEMBER 2,2025

mailto:LSCOZZARI@SCOZZARI.COM
mailto:AR@BRSERVICEINC.COM
mailto:PAXMUNDUS@OUTLOOK.COM
mailto:BOBHEARHJR@YAHOO.COM


Item

No. Description Unit Qty. Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 General Conditions (Construction Permits,

Insurance)

Lump 1  $             10,000.00  $              10,000.00  $               10,000.00  $             10,000.00  $            148,000.00  $                      148,000.00  $                     27,500.00 

2 Bonding Lump 1  $             12,000.00  $              12,000.00  $               30,000.00  $             30,000.00  $              18,024.00  $                         18,024.00  $                     18,650.00 

3 Materials lump 1  $             75,000.00  $              75,000.00  $               41,900.00  $             41,900.00  $              89,000.00  $                         89,000.00  $                     17,100.00 

4 Mobilization Lump 1  $               7,500.00  $                7,500.00  $               10,000.00  $             10,000.00  $              59,524.00  $                         59,524.00  $                       6,000.00 

3 Site Clearing Lump 1  $               1,500.00  $                1,500.00  $               10,000.00  $             10,000.00  $              24,000.00  $                         24,000.00  $                     30,000.00 

6 Demolition Lump 1  $             42,243.00  $              42,243.00  $             100,000.00  $          100,000.00  $              32,350.00  $                         32,350.00  $                     65,000.00 

7 Soil Erosion Control LF 125  $                    10.00  $                1,250.00  $                     240.00  $             30,000.00  $                      90.00  $                         11,250.00  $                       3,000.00 

8 Scaffolding LF 250  $                    40.00  $              10,000.00  $                       80.00  $             20,000.00  $                    500.00  $                      125,000.00  $                     40,500.00 

9 Temporary Shoring Tower 4  $               1,500.00  $                6,000.00  $               10,000.00  $             40,000.00  $              10,000.00  $                         40,000.00  $                     25,000.00 

10 Asphalt SF 1,750  $                       6.00  $              10,500.00  $                       60.00  $          105,000.00  $                      18.00  $                         31,500.00  $                     19,200.00 

11 Concrete CUYD 14  $               4,000.00  $              56,000.00  $                     300.00  $               4,200.00  $                    400.00  $                           5,600.00  $                     34,500.00 

12 Exterior Vinyl Siding SF 3,000  $                    10.00  $              30,000.00  $                       20.00  $             60,000.00  $                      12.00  $                         36,000.00  $                     41,000.00 

13 Structural Steel Tonnage 5  $               7,000.00  $              35,000.00  $                  2,000.00  $             10,000.00  $              10,000.00  $                         50,000.00  $                     20,000.00 

14 New Exterior Wall 2x6 Wood Stud SF 3,000  $                       5.00  $              15,000.00  $                       50.00  $          150,000.00  $                      12.00  $                         36,000.00  $                     30,000.00 

15 Roofing Metal and Trim Board SF 720  $                    10.00  $                7,200.00  $                       70.00  $             50,400.00  $                      50.00  $                         36,000.00  $                     20,000.00 

16 Caulking LF 195  $                    50.00  $                9,750.00  $                       20.00  $               5,000.00  $                        8.00  $                           1,560.00  $                     20,000.00 

17 Interior/Exterior T-11 Plywood SF 4,800  $                    10.00  $              48,000.00  $                       15.00  $             72,000.00  $                      10.00  $                         48,000.00  $                       8,000.00 

18 Glass and Glazing Acrylic Windows SF 240  $                    50.00  $              12,000.00  $                     100.00  $             24,000.00  $                      90.00  $                         21,600.00  $                     12,500.00 

19 Clean-up/Temp. Protection LF 120  $                    30.00  $                3,600.00  $                       20.00  $               2,400.00  $                      50.00  $                           6,000.00  $                     36,200.00 

LABOR

20 Structural Steel Hours 300  $                  200.00  $              60,000.00  $                     100.00  $             30,000.00  $                    150.00  $                         45,000.00  $                     28,000.00 

21 Electrical Hours 76  $                  150.00  $              11,400.00  $                     125.00  $               9,500.00  $                    150.00  $                         11,400.00  $                       7,200.00 

22 Carpentry Hours 250  $                  400.00  $           100,000.00  $                     100.00  $             25,000.00  $                    125.00  $                         31,250.00  $                   276,600.00 

23 Roofing Repairs Hours 32  $                  150.00  $                4,800.00 100.00$                   $               3,200.00  $                    106.25  $                           3,400.00  $                     34,000.00 

24 Asphalt Hours 120  $                  100.00  $              12,000.00  $                     100.00  $             12,000.00  $                    105.00  $                         12,600.00  $                     15,000.00 

25 General Labor Hours 134  $                  250.00  $              33,500.00  $                     100.00  $             13,400.00  $                      90.00  $                         12,060.00  $                   135,000.00 

26 Supervision (Prevailing Wage Employees) Wks. 20  $               5,000.00  $           100,000.00  $                  2,500.00  $             50,000.00  $                 2,500.00  $                         50,000.00  $                     30,000.00 

BID TOTAL:  $                                         714,243.00  $                                           918,000.00  $                                                    985,118.00  $                                                           999,950.00 

AB2025-44

COST PROPOSAL

SCOZZARI BUILDERS INC. BEST RESTORATION SERVICES INC. PAX MUNDUS EXTERISE LLC RICASOLI & SANTIN



NO. OF BIDDERS: 9

NAME OF BIDDER BETTINA SHOLK REAL ESTATE APPRAISAL CBRE, INC. MARK TINDER APPRAISALS LLC. MARTIN APPRAISAL ASSOCIATES INC. OTTEAU GROUP INC. 

ADDRESS 5 ROSEMARY ROAD 1000 ATRIUM WAY SUITE 101 34 E. MAIN STREET, SUITE 2, 3525  QUAKERBRIDGE RD SUITE 5200 100 MATAWAN ROAD 

CITY, STATE, ZIP EAST BRUNSWICK, NJ. 08816 MOUNT LAUREL, NJ. 08054 SOMERVILLE, NJ. 08876 HAMILTON, NJ. 08619 MATAWAN NJ, 07747

CONTACT BETTINA D. SHOLK, PRINCIPAL APPRAISER ALBERT R CROSBY  MAI MARK W. TINDER RICHARD J. CARABELLI CHRISTOPHER J. OTTEAU

TELEPHONE 732-254-4410 215-561-8734 908-526-1226 609-438-9063 732-518-2580

E-MAIL BSHOLK2@COMCAST.NET ALBERT.CROSBY@CBRE.COM MARK@MARKTINDERAPPRAISALS.COM MARTINMAICRE@GMAIL.COM ORDERS@OTTEAU.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION SBE N/A N/A N/A N/A

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REFERENCES AND EXPERIENCE TO BE REVIEWED BY AGENCY TO BE REVIEWD BY AGENCY NOT INCLUDED TO BE REVIEWED BY AGENCY TO BE REVIEWED BY AGENCY

QUALIFICATION STATEMENT INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

RUSSIA CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION 0111310, OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED 1731107, OK 0084046, OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED NOT INCLUDED 

EEO/AFFIRMATIVE ACTION COMPLIANCE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

EIC 33453, EXP. 6.15.2031 REQUIRED IF AWARDED 52001 EXP. 12.15.2028 8848 EXP. 11.15.2026 REQUIRED IF AWARDED

CONTINUITY OF OPERATION YES YES YES YES REQUIRED IF AWARDED

GENERAL APPRAISER LIC
BETTINA D. SHOLK; LIC # 42RG00137600; 

EXP. 12.31.2025

ALBERT R. CROSBY; LIC # 

42RG00222000; EXP. 12.31.2025

MARK W. TINDER; LIC # 42RG00227300; 

EXP. 12.31.2025

RICARDO J. CARABELLI JR.; LIC # 

42RG00010800; EXP. 12.31.2025: DAVID 

J. LEVY; LIC # 42RG0059700; EXP. 

12.31.2025

CHRISTOPHER J. OTTEAU; LIC # 42RG00219400; 

EXP. 12.31.2025: HEATHER N. ESPOSITO; LIC # 

42RG00218800, EXP. 12.31.2025: CONNOR F. 

MONTFERRAT; LIC # 42RG00268800, EXP. 

12.31.2025; MITCHELL D. YOUNG; LIC. # 

42RG00286000; EXP. 12.31.2025

BID RESULTS

CC2025-34 REAL ESTATE APPRAISAL SERVICES FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PLANNING DIVISION 

BID OPENING: DECEMBER 2, 2025

mailto:BSHOLK2@COMCAST.NET
mailto:ALBERT.CROSBY@CBRE.COM
mailto:MARK@MARKTINDERAPPRAISALS.COM
mailto:MARTINMAICRE@GMAIL.COM
mailto:ORDERS@OTTEAU.COM


NO. OF BIDDERS:

NAME OF BIDDER MORTON SALT, INC.
RIVERSIDE CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS, 

INC. 
ATLANTIC SALT, INC.

EXTECH OPERATING LLC DBA 

BUILDING MATERIAL 

ADDRESS 444  LAKE STREET, SUITE 3000 355 NEWBOLD ROAD 134 MIDDLE STREET, SUITE 210 15 EAST UNION AVE 

CITY, STATE, ZIP CHICAGO, IL 60606 FAIRLESS HILLS, PA 19030 LOWELL, MA 01852 EAST RUTHERFORD NJ, 07073

CONTACT ANTHONY T. PATTON RICH AUGUSTENSEN SHELAGH E. MAHONEY SASHA ALESSANDRA 

TELEPHONE 855-665-4540 215-295-0777 978-453-4911 973-945-0161

FAX 312-896-9208 215-295-0630 978-251-8244 N/A

E-MAIL BIDS@MORTONSALT.COM RAUGUSTENSEN@SILVI.COM INFO@ATLANTICSALT.COM SALESSANDRA@EXTECHBUILDING.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A N/A N/A 

PORT LOCATION: PICKUP AVAILABLE YES YES YES NO 

ADDRESS 1121 BORDENTOWN ROAD 7900 N. RADCLIFF STREET 184 MARSH ST. N/A

CITY, STATE, ZIP MORRISVILLE, PA 19067 BRISTOL , PA 19007 NEWARK NJ, N/A

CONTACT FOR ORDERING OF SALT CUSTOMER SERVICE DEPT. RICH AUGUSTENSEN DIANA BANJANY NICK INCORVAIA 

TELEPHONE 1855-665- 4540 215-295-0777 718-816-7200 973-227-0552

FAX 630 -214 -0725 (ATTN:ROAD SALT DEPT) 215-295-0630 718-981-8420 N/A

EMAIL BUYROADSALT@MORTONSALT.COM RAUGUSTENSEN@SILVI.COM SALTLADY@ATLANTICSALT.COM NINCORVAIA@EXTECHBUILDING.COM

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE 

REQUIREMENTS
SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

RUSSIA FORM SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EIC 52685 EXPIRES 4.15.26 61550 EXPIRES 8.15.26 5836 EXPIRES 10.15.26 24368 EXPIRES 11.15.27

EXTEND TO COOP YES YES YES YES 

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE YES NO YES YES

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE YES YES ; SELLING 50PD BAGS 

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO

BID RESULTS 

BID OPENING: DECEMBER 3,2025

CK09MERCER2025-19 TREATED AND UNTREATED ROCK SALT AND SOLAR SALT FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND THE MERCER COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM 

4

mailto:RAUGUSTENSEN@SILVI.COM
mailto:INFO@ATLANTICSALT.COM
mailto:SALESSANDRA@EXTECHBUILDING.COM
mailto:BUYROADSALT@MORTONSALT.COM
mailto:RAUGUSTENSEN@SILVI.COM
mailto:SALTLADY@ATLANTICSALT.COM
mailto:NINCORVAIA@EXTECHBUILDING.COM


CK09MERCER2023-15 TREATED AND UNTREATED ROCK SALT AND SOLAR SALT FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND THE MERCER COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM UNTREATED TONS TREATED TONS SOLAR SALT UNTREATED TONS TREATED TONS SOLAR SALT
UNTREATED 

TONS
TREATED TONS SOLAR SALT UNTREATED TONS TREATED TONS SOLAR SALT

COUNTY  OF MERCER: (D.O.T. - 1,500 UNTREATED & 16,000 TREATED; 

P.C. - 600 TREATED)
1,500 16,600 500 1,500 16,600 500 1,500 16,600 500 NO BID NO BID 500

COST PER TON DELIVERED  $                  62.64 77.64$                 NO BID  $                 63.00 83.00$                 NO BID  $              89.00 99.00$                        119.00$                 NO BID NO BID 292.00$                   

TOTAL COST    *BASIS OF AWARD*  $          93,960.00  $     1,288,824.00  NO BID  $         94,500.00  $    1,377,800.00  NO BID  $    133,500.00  $            1,643,400.00  $           59,500.00 NO BID NO BID  $            146,000.00 

COST PER TON FOR PICK-UP BY CONTRACTING UNIT  $                  62.00 77.00$                  NO BID  $                 63.00 83.00$                 NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 246.00$                   

CK09MERCER2025-19  TREATED AND UNTREATED ROCK SALT AND SOLAR SALT FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER AND THE MERCER COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS PROPOSAL PAGE

MORTON SALT (PRIMARY) RIVERSIDE CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS (SECONDARY) ATLANTIC SALT INC. EXTECH BUILDING MATERIAL



NO. OF RESPONDENTS:

NAME OF RESPONDENT PERMA LLC PRIORITY GROUP SERVICES LLC

ADDRESS 9 CAMPUS DRIVE, SUITE 216 211 WARREN STREET UNIT 1 

CITY, STATE, ZIP PARSIPPANY, NJ 07054 NEWARK NJ, 07103

CONTACT JOSEPH P. HRUBASH EZEKIEL SEGUN

TELEPHONE 973- 659- 6577 914-292-9412

E-MAIL JHRUBASH@PERMAINC.COM SEGUN@PRIORITYGROUPS.COM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A 

ADDENDUM NO.ONE INCLUDED INCLUDED 

INSURANCE INDEMNIFICATION PAGE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE OK OK

EIC 4606 EXPIRES 10.15.28 68000 EXPIRES 7.15.29

EXHIBIT A  INCLUDED  INCLUDED 

IRAN/RUSSIA  CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

REFERENCES INCLUDED INCLUDED

QUALIFICATION STATEMENT INCLUDED INCLUDED

COST PER HOUR FIRST YEAR  $                                                                                   191,580.00  $                                                                                   343,200.00 

COST PER HOUR SECOND YEAR  $                                                                                   195,412.00  $                                                                                   377,520.00 

COST PER HOUR THIRD YEAR  $                                                                                   199,320.00  $                                                                                   415,272.00 

PROPOSAL RESULTS

RFP2025-16  EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR FOR THE MERCER COUNTY INSURANCE FUND COMMISSION

PROPOSAL OPENING : DECEMBER 4,2025 

mailto:JHRUBASH@PERMAINC.COM
mailto:SEGUN@PRIORITYGROUPS.COM


NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 5

NAME OF BIDDER AETNA LIFE INSURANCE COMPANY
AMERIHEALTH INSURANCE COMPANY 

OF NJ 

FOUNDATION RISK PARTNERS DBA 

EAGLE ROCK MANAGEMENT GROUP 

HORIZON BLUE CROSS BLUE SHIELD OF 

NJ 
LUCENT HEALTH SOLUTIONSLLC 

ADDRESS 151FARMINGTON AVENUE 
259 PROSPECT PLAINS ROAD, BUILDING 

M.
2 AQUARIUM DRIVE 3 PENN PLAZA EAST 424 CHURCH STREET 

CITY, STATE, ZIP HARTFORD CT, 06156 CRANBURY NJ, 08512 CAMDEN NJ, 08103 NEWARK NJ, 0715 NASHVILLE TN, 327219

CONTACT LAUREN COFFEY MICHAEL MURPHY JOSEPH G. DIVINCENZO DANIEL PALLOTTO ALEX ARNET 

TELEPHONE 800-872-3862 609-662-2437 856-420-2989 201-281-5173 612-940-0141

FAX 860-273-3382 N/A N/A N/A N/A 

E-MAIL AETNAPROPOSALS@AETNA.COM
MICHAEL.MURPHY@AMERIHEALTH.CO

M
JOEED@EAGLEROCKMG.COM

DANIEL_PALLOTTO@HORIZONBLUE.CO

M
ALEX.ARNET@LUCENTHEALTH.COM

ADDENDUM NO.ONE INCLUDED
ATTACHED WRONG ADDENDUM; 

COUNTY TO REVIEW 

ATTACHED WRONG ADDENDUM; 

COUNTY TO REVIEW 
INCLUDED INCLUDED

EIC 70963 EXPIRES 6.15.26 24260 EXPIRES 1.15.28 REQUIRED IF AWARDED 2250 EXPIRES 1.15.27 REQUIRED IF AWARDED

EEO OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED OK OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED

INSURANCE AND 

INDEMNIFICATION 

REQUIREMENTS

YES, EXEMPTIONS INCLUDED TO GET 

REVIEWED BY COUNTY 
REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED  AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED
SIGNED AND DATED WILL NEED TO 

CHECK YES OR NO 

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS 

REGISTRATION
OK OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED  AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

RUSSIA FORM SIGNED  AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED REQUIRED IF AWARDED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

REFERENCES/QUALIFICATIONS 
CONSULTANT/EVALUATION TEAM  TO 

REVIEW

CONSULTANT/EVALUATION TEAM  TO 

REVIEW

CONSULTANT/EVALUATION TEAM  TO 

REVIEW

CONSULTANT/EVALUATION TEAM  TO 

REVIEW

CONSULTANT/EVALUATION TEAM  TO 

REVIEW

COST 
CONSULTANT/EVALUATION TEAM  TO 

REVIEW

CONSULTANT/EVALUATION TEAM  TO 

REVIEW

CONSULTANT/EVALUATION TEAM  TO 

REVIEW

CONSULTANT/EVALUATION TEAM  TO 

REVIEW

CONSULTANT/EVALUATION TEAM  TO 

REVIEW

RFP RESULTS

RFP2025-13 SELF-INSURANCE MEDICAL CLAIMS ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES, AND MEDICAL INSURANCE

   BID OPENING DATE:  DECEMBER 5, 2025

mailto:AETNAPROPOSALS@AETNA.COM
mailto:MICHAEL.MURPHY@AMERIHEALTH.COM
mailto:MICHAEL.MURPHY@AMERIHEALTH.COM
mailto:JOEED@EAGLEROCKMG.COM
mailto:DANIEL_PALLOTTO@HORIZONBLUE.COM
mailto:DANIEL_PALLOTTO@HORIZONBLUE.COM
mailto:ALEX.ARNET@LUCENTHEALTH.COM


NO. OF RESPONDENTS: 3

NAME OF RESPONDENT CLAIMS RESOLUTION CORPORATION, INC. INSERVCO INSURANCE SERVICES, INC. TRISTAR CLAIMS MANAGEMENT SERVICES INC. 

ADDRESS 323 S. PITNEY ROAD SUITE 200 2 NORTH SECOND STREET 100 OCEANGATE SUITE 840

CITY, STATE, ZIP GALLOWAY, NJ 08205 HARRISBURG, PA 17101 LONG BRANCH CA, 9082

CONTACT DAVID HARRIS STACI L. ULP THOMAS J. VEALE 

TELEPHONE 973-731-5700 717-230-8300 EXT. 4057 562-495-6600

E-MAIL DHARRIS@CRCTPA.COM SULP@PNAT.COM TRSTARMARKETING@TRISTARGROUP.NET 

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A N/A 

ADDEDNDUM INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

INSURANCE INDEMNIFICATION PAGE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE OK OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED

EIC 52331 EXPIRES 3.15.28 5867 EXPIRES 10.15.31 REQUIRED IF AWARDED

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED/MUST CHECK YES OR NO SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

RUSSIA FORM SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

REFERENCES INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM TO REVIEW INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM TO REVIEW INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM TO REVIEW 

EXCEPTIONS NONE
COST INCLUDES CLAIMS ADMIN, BILL REVIEW 

AND PPO ACCESS
NONE 

QUALIFICATION STATEMENT INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

COST FOR SERVICES YEAR ONE  $                                                                    149,500.00  $                                                           515,689.00  $                                                             436,999.00 

COST FOR SERVICES YEAR TWO (OPTION)  $                                                                    153,000.00  $                                                           522,302.00  $                                                             454,479.00 

COST FOR SERVICES YEAR THREE (OPTION)  $                                                                    150,000.00  $                                                           522,302.00  $                                                             472,659.00 

PROPOSAL RESULTS

RFP2025-15 TPA THIRD PARTY CLAIMS ADMINISTRATOR FOR THE MERCER COUNTY INSURANCE COMMISSION

DECEMBER 5,2025

mailto:DHARRIS@CRCTPA.COM
mailto:SULP@PNAT.COM
mailto:TRSTARMARKETING@TRISTARGROUP.NET

