
NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 1

NAME OF RESPONDENTS TRENTON HEALTH TEAM INC. 

ADDRESS 35 CLARK STREET , SUITE 100

CITY, STATE, ZIP TRENTON NJ, 08611-1868

CONTACT GREGORY D. PAULSON 

TELEPHONE 609-610-1909

 E-MAIL GPAULSON@TRENTONHEALTHTEAM.ORG

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A 

INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS SIGNED AND DATED 

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION INCLUDED 

EIC 47639 EXPIRES 11.15.25

EXHIBIT A REQUIRED IF AWARDED 

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED 

IRAN FORM 
SIGNED AND DATED AND WILL NEED TO CHECK 

YES OR NO 

RUSSIA FORM SIGNED AND DATED

QUALIFICATION STATEMENT INCLUDED , EVALUATION TEAM TO REVIEW

ATTACHMENT A INCLUDED EVALUATION TEAM TO REVIEW 

REFERENCES INCLUDED EVALUATION TEAM TO REVIEW 

BUDGET FORMS  (ATTACHED) INCLUDED , EVALUATION TEAM TO REVIEW

EXCEPTIONS NONE 

FATAL FLAW NO

REP RESULTS

CC2025-21 OVERDOSE FATALITY REVIEW TEAM (OFRT)

RFP OPENING DATE: AUGUST 14,2025

AWARD IS  BASE ON COST AND OTHER FACTORS IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE COMPETITIVE CONTRACT PROCESS

mailto:GPAULSON@TRENTONHEALTHTEAM.ORG


NUMBER OF BIDDERS 2

NAME OF BIDDER SCHICHTELS NURSERY INC. SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY

ADDRESS 7420 PETERS ROAD 1385 EAST 36TH STREET 

CITY STATE ZIP SPRINGVILLE NY, 14141 CLEVELAND OH, 44114

CONTACT MATTHEW SCHICHTEL ROSALIN SANTIAGO 

TELEPHONE 716-592-9383 216-706-9250

FAX 716-592-4282 248-581-1433

E-MAIL MATTHEW@SCHICHTELS.COM BIDS@SITEONE.COM

NJ SAVI N/A N/A 

ADDENDUM INCLUDED INCLUDED 

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

EXHIBIT A REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED 

EIC 22005 EXPIRES 11.15.27 34998 EXPIRES 2.15.28

IRAN CERTIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

INSURANCE INDEMNIFICATION SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

CERTIFICATION OF NO- INVOLVEMENT IN RUSSIA SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED

REFERENCES TO BE REVIEWED BY AGENCY TO BE REVIEWED BY AGENCY 

BIDDER QUESTIONNAIRE INCLUDED, PC TO REVIEW INCLUDED, PC TO REVIEW 

NJ WALL/DEBARRED NO NO 

EXCEPTIONS NONE YES, PC TO REVIEW 

BID RESULTS 

AB2025-27 PURCHASE OF LANDSCAPE AND RESTORATION PLANTS FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION 

BID OPENING DATE:  AUGUST 14,2025

mailto:MATTHEW@SCHICHTELS.COM
mailto:BIDS@SITEONE.COM


DESCRIPTION 

% OFF 

WHOLESALE  LIST 

PRICE 

SHIPPING 
% OFF WHOLESALE  LIST 

PRICE 
SHIPPING 

LOT 1 TREES 0% YES 10%  NO 

LOT 2 SHRUBS 0% YES 10%  NO 

LOT 3 
POTTED TREES AND

SHRUBS 
0% YES 10%  NO 

LOT 4 TUBELINGS NO BID 5%  NO 

LOT 5 BARE ROOTS NO BID 0%  NO 

LOT 6 LIVE STAKES NO BID 0%  NO 

LOT 7 HERBACEOUS PLUGS NO BID 5%  NO 

LOT 8 SEEDS MIXES NO BID 5%  NO 

AB2025-27 BID PROPOSAL FORM 

SCHICHTELS NURSERY INC. SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY



NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 7

NAME OF RESPONDENT 
ADVOCATES FOR HUMAN POTENTIAL 

INC. 

HEALTH MANAGEMENT ASSOCIATES 

INC. 

BLATNER ASSOCIATES INC. DBA 

JANUS SOLUTIONS 
MORPH MENTORING 

ADDRESS 490- B BOSTON POST ROAD 2501 WOODLAKE CIRCLE SUITE 100 2621 18TH AVENUE 
101 CRAWFORDS CORNER RD , 

SUITE 4116

CITY, STATE, ZIP SUDBURY NY, 01776 OKEMOS MI, 48864 WALL NJ, 07719 HOLMDEL, NJ 07733

CONTACT DAMIEN NEWMAN KELLY JOHNSON THOMAS BLATNER DR. CHELSEY TANNER 

TELEPHONE 978-261-1485 517-482-9236 609-577-2506 848-469-0533

E-MAIL DNEWMAN@AHPNET.COM
PROPOSALS@HEALTHMANAGEMENT.

COM

CAROLINE@JANUS 

SOLUTIONS.COM

CTANNER@MORPHMENTORING.C

OM

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A N/A N/A 

ADDENDUM NO .ONE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION 

REQUIREMENTS
SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

IRAN/RUSSIA CERTIFICATIONS SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EXHIBIT A REQUIRED IF AWARDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

EMPLOYEE INFORMATION CERTIFICATE REQUIRED IF AWARDED 52195 EXPIRES 1.15.26 30485 EXPIRES 3.15.29 70698 EXPIRES 5.15.30

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY
INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM 

TO REVIEW 

INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM TO 

REVIEW 

REFERENCES
INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM 

TO REVIEW 

INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM TO 

REVIEW 

FEE SCHEDULE  $                                           250,000.00  $                                           178,420.00  $                                    121,935.00  $                                      270,000.00 

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE 

NAME OF RESPONDENT REACH 
SOCIAL POLICY RESEARCH 

ASSOCIATES INC. 
THE MOSS GROUP LLC 

ADDRESS 1020 GRAND CONCOURSE #3S 1333. BROADWAY , SUITE 510 1312 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE SE

CITY, STATE, ZIP BRONX NY, 10451 OAKLAND CA, 94612 WASHINGTON DC, 20003

CONTACT MONICA GEORGE - FIELDS ANDREW WIEGAND ANADORA MOSS 

TELEPHONE 917-475-1366 510-788-2455 770-605-6267

E-MAIL
MGFIELDS@REACHEDSOLUTIONS.CO

M
ANDREW.WIEGAND@SPRA.COM AMOSS@MOSSGROUP.US 

NJ SAVI DESIGNATION N/A N/A N/A WBE AND SBE 

ADDENDUM NO .ONE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION 

REQUIREMENTS
SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

IRAN/RUSSIA CERTIFICATIONS
SIGNED AND DATED/ WILL NEED TO 

CHECK YES OR NO OR IRAN FORM 
SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION REQUIRED IF AWARDED OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED OK

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED 

EXHIBIT A REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED OK

EMPLOYEE INFORMATION CERTIFICATE REQUIRED IF AWARDED 74324 EXPIRES 9.15.27 REQUIRED IF AWARDED 63410 EXPIRES 8.15.27

QUALIFICATION STATEMENT
INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM 

TO REVIEW 

INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM TO 

REVIEW 

REFERENCES
INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM TO 

REVIEW 

INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM 

TO REVIEW 

INCLUDED, EVALUATION TEAM TO 

REVIEW 

FEE SCHEDULE $94,000.00 ADDITIONAL TECH FEES.  $                                           158,146.00  $                                    198,797.20  INCLUDED 

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE 

RFP RESULTS

CC2025-22 CONSULTANT SERVICES FOR THE MERCER COUNTY CORRECTION CENTER REENTRY PROGRAM ASSESSMENT AND RELATED PROGRAM SERVICES 

RFP OPENING DATE:  AUGUST 15,2025

AWARD WILL BE BASE ON COST AND OTHER FACTORS IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE COMPETITIVE CONTRACT PROCESS 

mailto:DNEWMAN@AHPNET.COM
mailto:PROPOSALS@HEALTHMANAGEMENT.COM
mailto:PROPOSALS@HEALTHMANAGEMENT.COM
mailto:CAROLINE@JANUS%20SOLUTIONS.COM
mailto:CAROLINE@JANUS%20SOLUTIONS.COM
mailto:CTANNER@MORPHMENTORING.COM
mailto:CTANNER@MORPHMENTORING.COM
mailto:MGFIELDS@REACHEDSOLUTIONS.COM
mailto:MGFIELDS@REACHEDSOLUTIONS.COM
mailto:ANDREW.WIEGAND@SPRA.COM
mailto:AMOSS@MOSSGROUP.US

