BID RESULTS

CCKOIMERCER2025-12 PRINTING SERVICES FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1) YEAR WITH AN OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) YEAR FOR THE COUNTY OF MERCER

BID OPENING DATE: AUGUST 8, 2025

NUMBER OF BIDDERS:

12

NAME OF BIDDER

ALL-STATE INTERNATIONAL INC

AMERICA GLOBAL SUPPLY LLC.

AVANTA BID LLC.

BUYME TX LLC.

CCONCEPT PRINT

ENVELOPES & PRINTED PRODUCTS INC.

ADDRESS

1| COMMERCE DRIVE

30 UNION STREET SUITE 96

1710 BRIARGATE BLVD. STE. 123

3307 SUMAC DR

40 LYDECKER STR

135 FAIRVIEW AVE.

CITY, STATE, 2IP

CRANFORD, NJ.07016

ELIZABETH, NJ. 07202

CCOLORADO SPRINGS, CO. 80920

KATY, TX. 77494

NYACK, NY. 10960

PROSPECT PARK, NJ. 07508

CONTACT BRANDON MILLER ANTONIETA TORRELLAS GABRIELA EVANS CARLOS SUAREZ JORDAN CAMPOS WILLIAM HIGGINS
TELEPHONE 908-634-5184 888-455-4441 888-243-0097 832-293-4167 845-353-4040 973-942-1232
E-MAIL BMILLER@ASLEGAL COM INFO@AMERICAGLOBALSUPPLY.COM INFO@AVANTABID.COM INFO@BUYMETX.COM JORDAN@CONCEPTPRINT.COM REQUIRED IF AWARDED
NJSAVI N/A MWBE AND SBE N/A MBE WBE SBE
ADDENUM NO. ONE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED INCLUDED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION 0100654, OK 3108273, OK 3140696, OK 3120987, OK 0107619. OK 0087800.0K

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

EEQ/ AFFRMATIVE ACTION COMPLIANCE

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED!

EIC/AA302

1758 EXP_ 04152027

76448 EXP_5.152032

SIGNED AND DATED
7152032

76449 EXP_05.15.2032

REQURIED IF AWARDED

34694 EXP_11.15.0031

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQURIED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

SIGEND AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

REQURIED IF AWARDED

SIGNED AND DATED

CONTINUITY FOR EMERGENCY

REEQUIRED IF AWARDED
YES

CERT OF NON-INVOLVEMENT IN PROHIBITED ACTIVITIES IN
RUSSIA OR BELARUS

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

EXTEND TO COOP

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

CERTIFY PAGE

SIGNED

SIGNED

SIGNED.

SIGNED.

SIGNED

SIGNED.

IRAN DISCLOSURE

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

WALL oK oK oK oK oK OK
REFERENCES REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED NOT INCLUDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED
EXCEPTIONS YES AGENCY TO REVIEW. YES. AGENCY TO REVIEW NONE NONE NONE NONE

DID NOTINCLUDE ADDENDUM
FATAL FLAW NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE

MJEM COMMUNICATIONS INC.
NAME OF BIDDER GROSSI CONSULTTING HAWK GRAPHICS INC. MASTER OFFICE SUPPLY LLC SEMCO USA DBA ALPHAGRAPHICS MERCER WORD CENTER PRINTING

180 BERNARD DRIVE

2312 STEARNS ST. APT2

150 RIVER ROAD G-4A

COUNTY
'50 DIVISION STREET SUITE 501

1072 ESTATES BLVD.

RED BANK, NJ.07701

1248 SUSSEX TPK. BLDG C. DOOR C-8
RANDOLPH. NJ_ 07869

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

HAMILTON NJ. 08690

MARILYN SILVERMAN

NTA CLIFF GROSS JOHN A BATAGLINO SANDY TAVARES WILLIAM GUZMAN REQUIRED IF AWARDED
TELEPHONE 9179219941 973-895-5569 833-644-4600 973-439-1680 732-247-0809 9-586-5825
E-MAIL CLIFF@GROSSILLC.COM ) BATTAGLINO@HAWKGRAPHICS.COM INFO@MASTEROFFICESUPPLY.COM SEMCOUSA@OPTIMUM.NET REQUIRED IF AWARDED MARILYN@WORDCENTERPRINTING.COM
NJSAVI N/A N/A N/A N/A
ADDENUM NO. ONE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED INCLUDED INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED INCLUDED!
NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION REQUIRE IF AWARDED 0070171.0K 3097017.OK 2719323 OK REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED!

EEQ/ AFFIRMATIVE ACTION COMPLIANCE

SIGNED AND DATED!

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

EIC/AA-302

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

76003 EXP. 4.15.2032

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION
CONTINUITY FOR EMERGENCY

SIGNED AND DATED!
YES

SIGNED AND DATED
YES.

SIGNED AND DATED
YES

SIGNED AND DATED
YES

SIGNED AND DATED
YES

REQUIRED IF AWARDED
YES

‘CERT OF NON-INVOLVEMENT IN PROHIBITED ACTIVITIES IN
RUSSIA OR BELARUS

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

SIGNED AND DATED

EXTEND TO COOP YES YES YES

CERTIFY PAGE YES YES SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED

IRAN DISCLOSURE SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED SIGNED AND DATED
WALL oK

REFERENCES REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED
EXCEPTIONS NONE YES TO BE REVIEWED BY AGENCY NONE NONE NONE NONE

FATAL FLAW NONE NONE NONE NONE WRONG PROPOSAL FORM USED NONE



mailto:BMILLER@ASLEGAL.COM
mailto:INFO@AMERICAGLOBALSUPPLY.COM
mailto:INFO@AVANTABID.COM
mailto:INFO@BUYMETX.COM
mailto:JORDAN@CONCEPTPRINT.COM
mailto:CLIFF@GROSSILLC.COM
mailto:J.BATTAGLINO@HAWKGRAPHICS.COM
mailto:INFO@MASTEROFFICESUPPLY.COM
mailto:SEMCOUSA@OPTIMUM.NET
mailto:MARILYN@WORDCENTERPRINTING.COM
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SPECIALIZED PRINTED ITEMS
UNIT COST
MERCER COUNTY PROSECUTORS OFFICE QTy BASIS OF AWARD
1|CRIMINAL AND FORTEITURE FILE JACKETS 5400 $ 2.95 |EACH I
2[VICTIM NOTIFICATIONI FORMS 24lbs NO BID
3|CYBER CRIMES FORMS 24lbs NO BID
4|FORFEITURE UNIT ENVELOPES 400 PER BX NO BID
5[PROSECUTOR ENVELOPES 5000 0.59
MERCER COUNTY PLANNING DEPARTMENT
6[LAND DEVELOPMENT STANDARDS 25 NO BID
7[MOBILITY ELEMENT OF MASTER PLAN 25 NO BID
MERCER COUNTY CORRECTIONS CENTER
8|CALENDAR FOLDERS 24lbs NO BID
9[DISCIPLINARY FOLDER 24lbs NO BID
10|GREIVANCE AND COMPLAINT 3 PART NCR 24lbs NO BID
11{ INMATE JACKET MANILLA ENVELOPE 50lbs $ 0.59 |EACH I
12|INMATE RECIEPT BOOK 100 NO BID
13|ADJUDICATION OF DISCIPLINARY FORMS 24lbs NO BID
MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION
14|CALENDAR OF EVENTS 100LBS NO BID
15(SELF GUIDED TOUR 100LBS NO BID
16(PROGRAM BOOKLETS 200 NO BID
17|COMMUNICATIONS (ANNUAL REPORT) 12 NO BID

MERCER COUNTY PURCHASING OFFICE

18

19

MANILLA FILE BACKER

ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

BUS SCHEDULES

OFFICE OF AGING

20

QUARTERLY NEWSLETTER

50lbs S 0.38 |EACH

ALL STATE INTERNATIONAL I
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SPECIALIZED PRINTED ITEMS
MERCER COUNTY PROSECUTORS OFFICE Qry UNIT COST
BASIS OF AWARD
1(CRIMINAL AND FORTEITURE FILE JACKETS 5400 NO BID
2[VICTIM NOTIFICATIONI FORMS 24ibs NO BID
3|CYBER CRIMES FORMS 241bs NO BID
4|FORFEITURE UNIT ENVELOPES 400 PER BX NO BID
5|PROSECUTOR ENVELOPES 5000 NO BID
MERCER COUNTY PLANNING DEPARTMENT _
6|LAND DEVELOPMENT STANDARDS 25 NO BID
7[MOBILITY ELEMENT OF MASTER PLAN 25 NO BID

MERCER COUNTY CORRECTIONS CENTER

8|CALENDAR FOLDERS 24lbs NO BID
9[DISCIPLINARY FOLDER 24lbs NO BID
10|GREIVANCE AND COMPLAINT 3 PART NCR 24lbs NO BID
11| INMATE JACKET MANILLA ENVELOPE 50lbs NO BID
12|INMATE RECIEPT BOOK 100 NO BID
13|ADJUDICATION OF DISCIPLINARY FORMS 24lbs NO BID

MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION

14|CALENDAR OF EVENTS 100LBS NO BID
15|SELF GUIDED TOUR 100LBS NO BID
16|PROGRAM BOOKLETS 200 NO BID
17|COMMUNICATIONS (ANNUAL REPORT) 12 NO BID

MERCER COUNTY PURCHASING OFFICE

MANILLA FILE BACKER

ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

BUS SCHEDULES

OFFICE OF AGING

20(QUARTERLY NEWSLETTER

AMERICAN GLOBAL SUPPLY I
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SPECIALIZED PRINTED ITEMS
MERCER COUNTY PROSECUTORS OFFICE Qry UNIT COST
BASIS OF AWARD
1(CRIMINAL AND FORTEITURE FILE JACKETS 5400
2[VICTIM NOTIFICATIONI FORMS 24ibs
3|CYBER CRIMES FORMS 24lbs
4|FORFEITURE UNIT ENVELOPES 400 PER BX
5|PROSECUTOR ENVELOPES 5000

MERCER COUNTY PLANNING DEPARTMENT _

6[LAND DEVELOPMENT STANDARDS 25
7[MOBILITY ELEMENT OF MASTER PLAN 25
MERCER COUNTY CORRECTIONS CENTER _
8|CALENDAR FOLDERS 24lbs
9[DISCIPLINARY FOLDER 24lbs
10|GREIVANCE AND COMPLAINT 3 PART NCR 24lbs
11| INMATE JACKET MANILLA ENVELOPE 50lbs
12|INMATE RECIEPT BOOK 100
13|ADJUDICATION OF DISCIPLINARY FORMS 24lbs
MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION
14|CALENDAR OF EVENTS 100LBS
15|SELF GUIDED TOUR 100LBS
16|PROGRAM BOOKLETS 200
17|COMMUNICATIONS (ANNUAL REPORT) 12

MERCER COUNTY PURCHASING OFFICE

MANILLA FILE BACKER

ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

BUS SCHEDULES

OFFICE OF AGING

20

QUARTERLY NEWSLETTER

AVANTA |
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SPECIALIZED PRINTED ITEMS
MERCER COUNTY PROSECUTORS OFFICE Qry UNIT COST
BASIS OF AWARD
1(CRIMINAL AND FORTEITURE FILE JACKETS 5400 NO BID
2|VICTIM NOTIFICATIONI FORMS 241bs NO BID
3|CYBER CRIMES FORMS 241bs NO BID
4|FORFEITURE UNIT ENVELOPES 400 PER BX NO BID
5|PROSECUTOR ENVELOPES 5000 NO BID
MERCER COUNTY PLANNING DEPARTMENT _
6|LAND DEVELOPMENT STANDARDS 25 NO BID
7|MOBILITY ELEMENT OF MASTER PLAN 25 NO BID
MERCER COUNTY CORRECTIONS CENTER _
8|CALENDAR FOLDERS 241bs NO BID
9|DISCIPLINARY FOLDER 241bs NO BID
10|GREIVANCE AND COMPLAINT 3 PART NCR 241bs NO BID
11| INMATE JACKET MANILLA ENVELOPE 50lbs NO BID
12|INMATE RECIEPT BOOK 100 NO BID
13|ADJUDICATION OF DISCIPLINARY FORMS 241bs NO BID
MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION
14|CALENDAR OF EVENTS 100LBS NO BID
15|SELF GUIDED TOUR 100LBS NO BID
16/|PROGRAM BOOKLETS 200 NO BID
17|COMMUNICATIONS (ANNUAL REPORT) 12 NO BID

MERCER COUNTY PURCHASING OFFICE

MANILLA FILE BACKER

ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

BUS SCHEDULES

OFFICE OF AGING

20

QUARTERLY NEWSLETTER

BUYME TX LLC |
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SPECIALIZED PRINTED ITEMS
MERCER COUNTY PROSECUTORS OFFICE Qry UNIT COST
BASIS OF AWARD
1(CRIMINAL AND FORTEITURE FILE JACKETS 5400 S 6,490.00
2|VICTIM NOTIFICATIONI FORMS 241bs S 7,995.00
3|CYBER CRIMES FORMS 24lbs S 495.00
4|FORFEITURE UNIT ENVELOPES 400 PER BX S 895.00
5|PROSECUTOR ENVELOPES 5000 S 5,995.00
MERCER COUNTY PLANNING DEPARTMENT _
6|LAND DEVELOPMENT STANDARDS 25 NO BID
7|MOBILITY ELEMENT OF MASTER PLAN 25 NO BID
MERCER COUNTY CORRECTIONS CENTER _
8|CALENDAR FOLDERS 241bs S 2,995.00
9|DISCIPLINARY FOLDER 241bs S 2,995.00
10|GREIVANCE AND COMPLAINT 3 PART NCR 241bs S 2,945.00
11| INMATE JACKET MANILLA ENVELOPE 50lbs S 6,490.00
12|INMATE RECIEPT BOOK 100 S 2,950.00
13|ADJUDICATION OF DISCIPLINARY FORMS 241bs S 2,179.00
MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION
14|CALENDAR OF EVENTS 100LBS NO BID
15|SELF GUIDED TOUR 100LBS NO BID
16/|PROGRAM BOOKLETS 200 NO BID
17|COMMUNICATIONS (ANNUAL REPORT) 12 NO BID

MERCER COUNTY PURCHASING OFFICE

MANILLA FILE BACKER

ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

BUS SCHEDULES

OFFICE OF AGING

20

QUARTERLY NEWSLETTER 2,795.00

ENVELOPES& PRINTED I
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SPECIALIZED PRINTED ITEMS

MERCER COUNTY PROSECUTORS OFFICE ary UNIT COST
BASIS OF AWARD
1|CRIMINAL AND FORTEITURE FILE JACKETS 5400 NO BID
2(VICTIM NOTIFICATIONI FORMS 24lbs S 3,162.50 |27.5m
3|(CYBER CRIMES FORMS 24lbs S 460.00 [1m
4|FORFEITURE UNIT ENVELOPES 400 PER BX NO BID
5|PROSECUTOR ENVELOPES 5000 NO BID
MERCER COUNTY PLANNING DEPARTMENT
6(LAND DEVELOPMENT STANDARDS 25 S 506.00
7 [MOBILITY ELEMENT OF MASTER PLAN 25 S 484.00
MERCER COUNTY CORRECTIONS CENTER
8(CALENDAR FOLDERS 24lbs S 370.00 |1m
9(DISCIPLINARY FOLDER 24lbs S 370.00 |1m
10|GREIVANCE AND COMPLAINT 3 PART NCR 24lbs S 248.75 |8m
11| INMATE JACKET MANILLA ENVELOPE 50lbs NO BID
12|INMATE RECIEPT BOOK 100 S 1,330.00 |BID SIZE 8.5X11.5 ; 5.5 x8.9-$991.00 no size

ADJUDICATION OF DISCIPLINARY FORMS

MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION

14 [CALENDAR OF EVENTS

100LBS

1,750.00

1,255.00

SELF GUIDED TOUR

100LBS

1,600.00

PROGRAM BOOKLETS

200

350.00

COMMUNICATIONS (ANNUAL REPORT)

MERCER COUNTY PURCHASING OFFICE

12

19

MANILLA FILE BACKER

ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

BUS SCHEDULES

OFFICE OF AGING

20

QUARTERLY NEWSLETTER

50lbs NO BID

w[n|n|n

530.04

QUOTING 4/4; $100-$150.00

HAWK GRAPHICS |
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SPECIALIZED PRINTED ITEMS
MERCER COUNTY PROSECUTORS OFFICE Qry UNIT COST
BASIS OF AWARD
1(CRIMINAL AND FORTEITURE FILE JACKETS 5400 NO BID
2|VICTIM NOTIFICATIONI FORMS 241bs NO BID
3|CYBER CRIMES FORMS 241bs NO BID
4|FORFEITURE UNIT ENVELOPES 400 PER BX NO BID
5|PROSECUTOR ENVELOPES 5000 NO BID
MERCER COUNTY PLANNING DEPARTMENT _
6|LAND DEVELOPMENT STANDARDS 25 NO BID
7|MOBILITY ELEMENT OF MASTER PLAN 25 NO BID
MERCER COUNTY CORRECTIONS CENTER _
8|CALENDAR FOLDERS 241bs NO BID
9|DISCIPLINARY FOLDER 241bs NO BID
10|GREIVANCE AND COMPLAINT 3 PART NCR 241bs NO BID
11| INMATE JACKET MANILLA ENVELOPE 50lbs NO BID
12|INMATE RECIEPT BOOK 100 NO BID
13|ADJUDICATION OF DISCIPLINARY FORMS 241bs NO BID
MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION
14|CALENDAR OF EVENTS 100LBS NO BID
15|SELF GUIDED TOUR 100LBS NO BID
16/|PROGRAM BOOKLETS 200 NO BID
17|COMMUNICATIONS (ANNUAL REPORT) 12 NO BID

MERCER COUNTY PURCHASING OFFICE

MANILLA FILE BACKER

ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

BUS SCHEDULES

OFFICE OF AGING

20

QUARTERLY NEWSLETTER

MASTER OFFICE |
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SPECIALIZED PRINTED ITEMS
MERCER COUNTY PROSECUTORS OFFICE ary UNIT COST
BASIS OF AWARD
1[CRIMINAL AND FORTEITURE FILE JACKETS 5400 S 165
2|VICTIM NOTIFICATIONI FORMS 241bs NO BID
3|CYBER CRIMES FORMS 241bs 3 0.67
4|FORFEITURE UNIT ENVELOPES 400 PER BX NO BID
5|PROSECUTOR ENVELOPES 5000 S 0.12
MERCER COUNTY PLANNING DEPARTMENT
6|LAND DEVELOPMENT STANDARDS 25 $ 85.00
7|MOBILITY ELEMENT OF MASTER PLAN 25 NO BID
MERCER COUNTY CORRECTIONS CENTER
8| CALENDAR FOLDERS 241bs NO BID
9| DISCIPLINARY FOLDER 241bs NO BID
10| GREIVANCE AND COMPLAINT 3 PART NCR 241bs NO BID
11| INMATE JACKET MANILLA ENVELOPE 50lbs NO BID
12[INMATE RECIEPT BOOK 100 NO BID
13[ADJUDICATION OF DISCIPLINARY FORMS 241bs NO BID
MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION
14| CALENDAR OF EVENTS 100LBS S 0.19
15[SELF GUIDED TOUR 100LBS S 0.26
16|PROGRAM BOOKLETS 200 S 0.26
COMMUNICATIONS (ANNUAL REPORT) % NO BID
MERCER COUNTY PURCHASING OFFICE
MANILLA FILE BACKER
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT
BUS SCHEDULES $ 0.36
OFFICE OF AGING
20| QUARTERLY NEWSLETTER

WORD CENTER |

1500 FOLDED
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MERCER COUNTY PURCHASING OFFICE

MANILLA FILE BACKER

ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

BUS SCHEDULES

OFFICE OF AGING

20

QUARTERLY NEWSLETTER

SPECIALIZED PRINTED ITEMS
MERCER COUNTY PROSECUTORS OFFICE Qry UNIT COST
BASIS OF AWARD
1(CRIMINAL AND FORTEITURE FILE JACKETS 5400 S 6,100.00
2|VICTIM NOTIFICATIONI FORMS 241bs NO BID
3|CYBER CRIMES FORMS 241bs NO BID
4|FORFEITURE UNIT ENVELOPES 400 PER BX NO BID
5|PROSECUTOR ENVELOPES 5000 NO BID
MERCER COUNTY PLANNING DEPARTMENT _
6|LAND DEVELOPMENT STANDARDS 25 NO BID
7|MOBILITY ELEMENT OF MASTER PLAN 25 NO BID
MERCER COUNTY CORRECTIONS CENTER _
8|CALENDAR FOLDERS 241bs NO BID
9|DISCIPLINARY FOLDER 241bs NO BID
10|GREIVANCE AND COMPLAINT 3 PART NCR 241bs NO BID
11| INMATE JACKET MANILLA ENVELOPE 50lbs NO BID
12|INMATE RECIEPT BOOK 100 NO BID
13|ADJUDICATION OF DISCIPLINARY FORMS 241bs NO BID
MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION
14|CALENDAR OF EVENTS 100LBS NO BID
15|SELF GUIDED TOUR 100LBS NO BID
16/|PROGRAM BOOKLETS 200 NO BID
17|COMMUNICATIONS (ANNUAL REPORT) 12 NO BID
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